
Executive Summary

Direct Interactions, a US-based contact center company, successfully recruited, trained, and deployed 500 customer service agents in 72 hours 
to handle 5000 calls per day for a Florida state-run insurance carrier during hurricane Ian. The company's ability to scale up quickly and provide 
high-quality customer service during times of crisis is a testament to its expertise in the business process outsourcing (BPO) call center 
industry.

Zero to 500 Agents in 72 Hours

Introduction

Natural disasters and emergencies can be unpredictable and often cause chaos and confusion, leading to a surge in customer service inquiries. 
To handle the sudden increase in call volumes, companies need to quickly ramp up their customer service workforce. However, finding, hiring, 
and training hundreds of agents in a short amount of time can be a significant challenge.

Direct Interactions, a BPO provider, has been offering customer service solutions to its clients for over a decade. Its experience and expertise in 
scaling up operations during times of crisis has helped it gain a reputation as a reliable partner for BPO services.

Challenge

Hurricane Ian was a major storm that hit Florida, resulting in widespread damage and displacement of residents. With wind gusts that reached 
128 mph in Florida, rainfall totals greater than 20 inches, power outages that soared past 3 million.

The Florida state-run insurance carrier, which provides insurance coverage to homeowners in the state, needed to handle thousands of 
additional calls per day from customers seeking assistance with their claims.

Solution

Direct Interactions responded quickly to the Florida state-run insurance carrier 's call for help. The company was able to hire and train over 500 
customer service agents within 72 hours to provide support to the insurance company's customers.

Direct Interactions has a rigorous recruiting process that ensures it hires empathetic and caring agents who can provide high-quality customer 
service. The company's recruiters were able to find agents who had previously experienced hurricanes and could empathize with customers 
going through similar situations.

“We hire Americans that have been through it, to help Americans that are going through it.” 
- Jonas Nicholson, CEO, Direct Interactions

Direct Interactions also has a comprehensive training program that equips agents with the necessary skills to handle complex customer 
inquiries. The company's agents received training on the Florida state-run insurance carrier's policies and procedures, ensuring they were well-
prepared to handle customer inquiries.

Results

Direct Interactions successfully deployed over 500 agents to handle 5000 calls per day for the Florida state-run insurance carrier. The company's 
ability to ramp up quickly and provide high-quality customer service helped the insurance company manage the surge in call volumes and 
provide timely assistance to its customers.

Conclusion

Direct Interactions' ability to hire and train over 500 customer service agents within 72 hours to support the Florida state-run insurance carrier 
during hurricane Ian is a testament to its expertise in the BPO industry. The company's ability to scale up quickly and provide high-quality 
customer service during times of crisis can help its clients manage the surge in call volumes and maintain customer satisfaction levels. Direct 
Interactions' commitment to hiring empathetic and caring agents who can relate to customers going through difficult times is a unique 
advantage that sets the company apart from its competitors.


